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Open Letter to JFQ Readers
When Joint Force Quarterly readers see or hear the words National 
Defense University, they are most likely to think of the Joint Forces 
Staff College, the Industrial College of the Armed Forces, or perhaps 
the National War College. But NDU is much larger and more diversi-
fied than most realize. It is comprised of colleges, research centers, 
and regional centers that cover the waterfront of national defense and 
international security studies, and each is staffed by some of the most 
accomplished national security professionals in the world. Perhaps the 
most important thing that you should know about NDU is that the 
overarching mission binding its components together is supporting the 
combatant commands as they address the challenges of the day.

NDU’s five colleges and four research centers have all contributed in 
some way to the International Security Assistance Force efforts in  
Afghanistan, as well as to U.S. combat forces throughout the theater. 
These contributions involve the full spectrum of academic enhancement 
to theater analysis, from deploying military faculty members to the Joint 
Strategic Assessment Team, to planning collaboration with interagency 
counterparts in the National Capital Region, to refining joint profession-
al military education. Requests and requirements come in nearly daily, 
with varying direct and indirect potential for NDU support.

NDU is an enterprise chartered to support the joint warrior. I invite you 
to tap into the functional and regional skills and resources that you may 
not have previously realized were at your disposal here at NDU. This is 
an opportunity for you to access a professional cadre of national security 
experts who can take your well-framed inquiries to a level of analysis 
and other assistance that may be unavailable locally. My chief of staff, 
Colonel Mike Cannon, USA, can be reached at cannonm@ndu.edu.

Ann E. Rondeau
Vice Admiral, USN
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